
 
 
 
 

Public Health Advisory 

Food recalls due to Listeria 

January 10, 2022 
Nunavut-wide  

The Department of Health is warning about a food recall issued by the Canadian Food 

Inspection Agency (CFIA) due to possible listeria contamination.  

Dole Canada Company is recalling certain salad products from the marketplace due 

to possible listeria contamination. Consumers should not consume the recalled products 

described below.  

More information on this product recall can be found on the CFIA website here.  

This recalled product should be thrown out or returned to the location where it was 

purchased. 

Food contaminated with listeria may not look or smell spoiled but can still cause 

sickness. Short-term symptoms can include fever, headache, vomiting, nausea and 

neck stiffness. Pregnant women, Elders and people with weakened immune systems 

are particularly at risk. Pregnant women may experience only mild flu-like symptoms, 

but the infection can lead to infection of the newborn and stillbirth. Severe cases of the 

infection can lead to death. If you think you became sick from consuming a recalled 

product, call your local health centre. 

For more information, contact the Canadian Food Inspection Agency at 1-800-442-2342 

or visit www.inspection.gc.ca.  Sign up for food recalls at 

http://inspection.gc.ca/english/util/listserv/listsube.shtml. 

### 

Media Contact: 

Danarae Sommerville 
Communications Specialist  
Department of Health 
867-975-5712 
dsommerville1@gov.nu.ca  

  

https://recalls-rappels.canada.ca/en/alert-recall/certain-fresh-express-brand-salad-products-recalled-due-listeria-monocytogenes?utm_source=r_listserv
http://www.inspection.gc.ca/
http://inspection.gc.ca/english/util/listserv/listsube.shtml
mailto:dsommerville1@gov.nu.ca


List of recalled products: 

  

Brand Product Size UPC  CODES 

Dole Garden Salad 340g 0 71430 01135 5
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "B" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 8, 
2022 and 
All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Very Veggie 283g 0 71430 01008 2
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Greener Selection 312g 0 71430 00965 9
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole American Blend 340g 0 71430 00933 8
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Asian Island 
Crunch Supreme 
Kit 

368g 0 71430 01721 0
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Southwest Salad 
Supreme Kit 

369g 0 71430 01711 1
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Chop Chop Kit 
Peppercorn Ranch 

257g 0 71430 00098 4
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

Dole Chop Chop Kit 
Teriyaki Pineapple 

276g 0 71430 00182 0
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

President’s Choice Garden Salad 340g 0 60383 22268 0
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "B" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 8, 
2022 and 
All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 
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Communications 

President’s Choice Mixed Greens 340g 0 60383 00188 9
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

President’s Choice Ranch Salad Kit 347g 0 60383 00493 4
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "B" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 8, 
2022 and 
All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

President’s Choice Sesame Ginger Kit 369g 0 60383 02320 1
  
 

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "B" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 8, 
2022 and 
All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 

President’s Choice Southwest Salad 
Kit 

369g 0 60383 02319 5
  

All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "B" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 8, 
2022 and 
All packages bearing a lot code 
beginning with "W" and a Best Before 
date up to and including January 9, 
2022 


